

Bid Results: IFB 13-33

Fire Hydrants & Related Parts

Bid Opening: 10/24/2012 @ 11:00 AM

VENDORS

Hydrant & Related Parts	
Fire Hydrants 5 1/4"	
5'-Trench	
5'6" Trench	
Extension 5 1/4 "x 6"	
Extension 5 1/4 "x 12"	
Extension 5 1/4 "x 18"	
Repair Kits for Hydrants	
Wrenches	
16" Adj. Hydrant Wrench	
(Collision) Repair Kits	
Kennedy Kil	
Dresser 500	
Mueller 107	
Darling B62	
M&H 929	
Extension Kits	
Kennedy Kil	
6"	
12"	
Dresser 500	
6"	
12"	
Mueller 107	
6"	
12"	
M&H 929	
6"	
12"	
Total Section 2:	
Total Section 1:	
Total Contract Price:	

BRAND	WATER LINE SUPPLY	BRAND	HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS	BRAND	PIPE PLUS	BRAND	WATER WORKS SUPPLY
UNITED F-06	\$ 1,500.00	MUELLER	\$ 1,940.28	AMERICAN AVK	\$ 1,625.00	M&H 929	\$ 1,640.70
UNITED F-06	\$ 1,510.00	MUELLER	\$ 1,983.31	AMERICAN AVK	\$ 1,660.00	M&H 929	\$ 1,677.20
UNITED	\$ 160.00	MUELLER	\$ 318.50	AMERICAN AVK	\$ 308.00	M&H	\$ 173.51
UNITED	\$ 187.00	MUELLER	\$ 374.77	AMERICAN AVK	\$ 358.00	M&H	\$ 203.07
UNITED	\$ 212.00	MUELLER	\$ 424.41	AMERICAN AVK	\$ 407.00	M&H	\$ 232.88
UNITED	\$ 84.00	MUELLER	\$ 126.53	AMERICAN AVK	\$ 127.00	M&H	\$ 77.22
TRUMBELL	\$ 25.00	MUELLER	\$ 19.32	KENNEDY	\$ 55.00	REED	\$ 31.60
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 184.00		NO BID	KENNEDY	\$ 301.00	KENNEDY	\$ 179.44
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 90.00		NO BID	KENNEDY	\$ 150.00	HYDROFLO	\$ 103.50
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 76.00	MUELLER	\$ 126.53	KENNEDY	\$ 33.00	HRP	\$ 98.75
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 100.00	HRPI	\$ 118.90	KENNEDY	\$ 131.00	HRP	\$ 101.81
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 76.00	HRPI	\$ 140.17	KENNEDY	\$ 150.00	M&H	\$ 77.22
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 404.00		NO BID	KENNEDY	\$ 539.00	KENNEDY	\$ 394.56
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 491.00		NO BID	KENNEDY		KENNEDY	\$ 480.50
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 178.00		NO BID	KENNEDY	\$ 311.00	HYDROFLO	\$ 204.10
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 207.00		NO BID	KENNEDY	\$ 351.00	HYDROFLO	\$ 238.90
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 178.00	MUELLER	\$ 318.50	KENNEDY	\$ 275.00	HYDROFLO	\$ 217.00
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 201.00		\$ 374.77	KENNEDY	\$ 325.00	HYDROFLO	\$ 243.40
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 151.00	HRPI	\$ 232.00	KENNEDY	\$ 257.00	M&H	\$ 173.51
HYDRO/HRP	\$ 177.00	HRPI	\$ 264.87	KENNEDY	\$ 285.00	M&H	\$ 203.07
	\$ 2,538.00		\$ 1,595.06		\$ 3,361.00		\$ 2,747.36
	\$ 3,653.00		\$ 5,167.80		\$ 4,485.00		\$ 4,004.58
	\$ 6,191.00		\$ 6,762.86		\$ 7,846.00		\$ 6,751.94