

Price Form, IFB 15-44, Traffic Signs

	01/01/15 - 12/31/15
--	---------------------

[illegible]

MUTCD Regulatory/Warning/Const./ School/Other Signs:									
--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

4 x 4	1.53	0.65	No Bid	1.72	0.75	No Bid	2.01	1.1	No Bid	2.06	1.25	No Bid	2.06	1.25	No Bid
4 x 8	2.14	1.3	No Bid	2.36	1.3	No Bid	3.04	1.7	No Bid	3.09	1.95	No Bid	3.09	1.95	No Bid
12 x 6	2.52	2.9	No Bid	3.2	2.9	No Bid	4.58	4.84	No Bid	4.82	4.84	No Bid	4.82	4.84	No Bid
12 x 9	3.73	4.3	No Bid	4.49	4.3	No Bid	6.55	7.27	No Bid	6.98	7.27	No Bid	6.98	7.27	No Bid
12 x 12	4.21	5.8	No Bid	5.11	5.8	No Bid	7.9	9.7	No Bid	8.39	9.7	No Bid	8.39	9.7	No Bid
12 x 18	5.37	8.57	No Bid	6.84	8.57	No Bid	10.76	14.53	No Bid	11.5	14.53	No Bid	11.5	14.53	No Bid
12 x 24	6.75	11.43	No Bid	8.34	11.43	No Bid	13.63	19.38	No Bid	14.51	19.38	No Bid	14.51	19.38	No Bid
12 x 36	10.13	17.14	No Bid	12.51	17.14	No Bid	20.41	29.06	No Bid	21.88	29.06	No Bid	21.88	29.06	No Bid
21 x 15	7.39	12.51	No Bid	9.13	12.51	No Bid	14.91	21.22	No Bid	15.97	21.22	No Bid	15.97	21.22	No Bid
18 x 18	7.6	12.86	No Bid	9.39	12.86	No Bid	15.32	21.8	No Bid	16.42	21.8	No Bid	16.42	21.8	No Bid
18 x 24	10.13	17.14	No Bid	12.51	17.14	No Bid	20.41	29.06	No Bid	21.88	29.06	No Bid	21.88	29.06	No Bid
18 x 30	12.66	21.43	No Bid	15.64	21.43	No Bid	25.52	36.33	No Bid	27.36	36.33	No Bid	27.36	36.33	No Bid
18 x 36	15.18	25.71	No Bid	18.77	25.71	No Bid	30.63	43.6	No Bid	32.83	43.6	No Bid	32.83	43.6	No Bid
24 x 6	4.11	5.8	No Bid	5.02	5.8	No Bid	8.05	9.9	No Bid	8.54	9.9	No Bid	8.54	9.9	No Bid
24 x 24	13.51	22.86	No Bid	16.69	22.86	No Bid	17.42	38.75	No Bid	29.17	38.75	No Bid	29.17	38.75	No Bid
24 x 30	16.89	28.57	No Bid	20.85	28.57	No Bid	34.03	48.44	No Bid	36.49	48.44	No Bid	36.49	48.44	No Bid
24 x 36	20.26	34.28	No Bid	25.03	34.28	No Bid	40.83	58.13	No Bid	43.76	58.13	No Bid	43.76	58.13	No Bid
24 x 48	27.01	45.71	No Bid	33.37	45.71	No Bid	54.45	77.5	No Bid	58.42	77.5	No Bid	58.42	77.5	No Bid
30 x 30	21.11	35.71	No Bid	26.08	35.71	No Bid	42.54	60.55	No Bid	45.61	60.55	No Bid	45.61	60.55	No Bid
30 x 36	25.32	42.86	No Bid	31.28	42.86	No Bid	51.05	72.66	No Bid	54.72	72.66	No Bid	54.72	72.66	No Bid
30 x 48	33.76	57.14	No Bid	41.72	57.14	No Bid	68.05	96.88	No Bid	72.97	96.88	No Bid	72.97	96.88	No Bid
30 x 60	42.21	71.43	No Bid	52.15	71.43	No Bid	85.07	121.1	No Bid	91.21	121.1	No Bid	91.21	121.1	No Bid
36 x 36	30.44	51.43	No Bid	37.54	51.43	No Bid	61.25	87.19	No Bid	65.68	87.19	No Bid	65.68	87.19	No Bid
36 x 48	40.51	68.57	No Bid	50.06	68.57	No Bid	81.67	116.26	No Bid	87.56	116.26	No Bid	87.56	116.26	No Bid
48 x 48	54.02	91.42	No Bid	66.75	91.42	No Bid	108.9	155	No Bid	116.74	155	No Bid	116.74	155	No Bid
Flat/PB/DG White/Blue EC															
Film - 9 "	33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32	
Town Decal 2 per sign - 6"	25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5	

Unit Totals									
1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10
11	12	13	14	15	16	17	18	19	20
21	22	23	24	25	26	27	28	29	30
31	32	33	34	35	36	37	38	39	40
41	42	43	44	45	46	47	48	49	50
51	52	53	54	55	56	57	58	59	60
61	62	63	64	65	66	67	68	69	70
71	72	73	74	75	76	77	78	79	80
81	82	83	84	85	86	87	88	89	90
91	92	93	94	95	96	97	98	99	100

Unit Totals	\$ 16.74	\$ 27.90		\$ 20.66	\$ 27.90		\$ 33.16	\$ 47.28		\$ 35.94	\$ 47.29		\$ 35.94	\$ 47.29	
	\$ 477.76	\$ 740.34	No Bid	\$ 575.82	\$ 740.44	No Bid	\$ 888.25	\$ 1,224.77	No Bid	\$ 957.83	\$ 1,225.17	No Bid	\$ 957.83	#####	No Bid

MUTCD Signs Awarded to: Garden State

Price Form, IFB 15-44, Traffic Signs

	01/01/15 - 12/31/15
--	---------------------

	GS = Garden State						L = Lightle					OS = Ocean State			
	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS
Size (in inches)	Eng.	Eng.	Eng.	Prism	Prism	Prism	D.G.	D.G.	D.G.	FY	FY	FY	FG	FG	FG

[illegible]

4 x 4	1.81	0.9	No Bid	2.02	0.9	No Bid	2.37	1.5	No Bid	2.42	1.5	No Bid	2.42	1.5	No Bid
4 x 8	2.51	1.8	No Bid	2.79	1.8	No Bid	3.58	2.8	No Bid	3.64	2.8	No Bid	3.64	2.8	No Bid
12 x 6	2.96	3.6	No Bid	3.78	3.6	No Bid	5.38	5.9	No Bid	5.68	5.9	No Bid	5.68	5.9	No Bid
12 x 9	4.39	5.4	No Bid	5.28	5.4	No Bid	7.71	8.8	No Bid	8.15	8.8	No Bid	8.15	8.8	No Bid
12 x 12	4.81	7.2	No Bid	6.01	7.2	No Bid	9.29	11.5	No Bid	9.87	11.5	No Bid	9.87	11.5	No Bid
12 x 18	6.33	10.61	No Bid	8.05	10.61	No Bid	12.66	17.1	No Bid	13.53	17.1	No Bid	13.53	17.1	No Bid
12 x 24	7.94	14.15	No Bid	9.82	14.15	No Bid	16.04	22.8	No Bid	17.08	22.8	No Bid	17.08	22.8	No Bid
12 x 36	11.92	21.23	No Bid	14.15	21.23	No Bid	24.02	34.2	No Bid	25.75	34.2	No Bid	25.75	34.2	No Bid
21 x 15	8.7	15.5	No Bid	10.74	15.5	No Bid	17.54	24.97	No Bid	18.8	24.97	No Bid	18.8	24.97	No Bid
18 x 18	8.93	15.92	No Bid	11.05	15.92	No Bid	18.03	25.65	No Bid	19.33	25.65	No Bid	19.33	25.65	No Bid
18 x 24	11.92	21.23	No Bid	14.15	21.23	No Bid	24.02	34.2	No Bid	25.75	34.2	No Bid	25.75	34.2	No Bid
18 x 30	14.9	26.54	No Bid	18.4	26.54	No Bid	30.03	42.75	No Bid	32.19	42.75	No Bid	32.19	42.75	No Bid
18 x 36	17.86	31.89	No Bid	22.07	31.89	No Bid	36.03	51.3	No Bid	38.63	51.3	No Bid	38.63	51.3	No Bid
24 x 6	4.83	7.2	No Bid	5.9	7.2	No Bid	9.47	11.5	No Bid	10.04	11.5	No Bid	10.04	11.5	No Bid
24 x 24	15.89	28.3	No Bid	19.63	28.3	No Bid	32.03	45.6	No Bid	34.32	45.6	No Bid	34.32	45.6	No Bid
24 x 30	19.87	35.35	No Bid	24.54	35.35	No Bid	40.03	57	No Bid	42.93	57	No Bid	42.93	57	No Bid
24 x 36	23.83	42.42	No Bid	29.45	42.42	No Bid	48	68.4	No Bid	51.47	68.4	No Bid	51.47	68.4	No Bid
24 x 48	31.78	56.56	No Bid	39.18	56.56	No Bid	62.59	91.2	No Bid	67.14	91.2	No Bid	67.14	91.2	No Bid
30 x 30	24.83	44.19	No Bid	24.92	44.19	No Bid	50.05	71.25	No Bid	53.66	71.25	No Bid	53.66	71.25	No Bid
30 x 36	29.8	53.03	No Bid	36.8	53.03	No Bid	58.68	85.5	No Bid	63.64	85.5	No Bid	63.64	85.5	No Bid
30 x 48	45.49	70.7	No Bid	48.51	70.7	No Bid	78.27	114	No Bid	83.87	114	No Bid	83.87	114	No Bid
30 x 60	49.64	88.38	No Bid	59.94	88.38	No Bid	97.79	142.5	No Bid	104.84	142.5	No Bid	104.84	142.5	No Bid
36 x 36	35.81	63.63	No Bid	44.17	63.63	No Bid	70.4	102.6	No Bid	75.49	102.6	No Bid	75.49	102.6	No Bid
36 x 48	47.66	84.84	No Bid	57.54	84.84	No Bid	93.88	136.8	No Bid	100.65	136.8	No Bid	100.65	136.8	No Bid
48 x 48	63.55	113.12	No Bid	76.73	113.12	No Bid	125.17	182.4	No Bid	134.19	182.4	No Bid	134.19	182.4	No Bid
Flat/PB/DG White/Blue EC															
Film - 9 "	33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32		33.28	37.32	
Town Decal 2 per sign - 6"	25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5		25.99	5.5	

Unit Totals									
1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10
11	12	13	14	15	16	17	18	19	20
21	22	23	24	25	26	27	28	29	30
31	32	33	34	35	36	37	38	39	40
41	42	43	44	45	46	47	48	49	50
51	52	53	54	55	56	57	58	59	60
61	62	63	64	65	66	67	68	69	70
71	72	73	74	75	76	77	78	79	80
81	82	83	84	85	86	87	88	89	90
91	92	93	94	95	96	97	98	99	100

Unit Totals	\$ 19.92	\$ 34.55		\$ 23.82	\$ 34.55		\$ 38.92	\$ 55.69		\$ 41.72	\$ 55.69		\$ 41.72	\$ 55.69	
	\$ 557.23	\$ 906.51	No Bid	\$ 654.89	\$ 906.51	No Bid	\$ 1,032.33	\$ 1,435.04	No Bid	\$ 1,102.33	\$ 1,435.04	No Bid	\$ 1,102.33	\$ 1,435.04	No Bid

Non MUTCD Signs Awarded to: Garden State

Price Form, IFB 15-44, Traffic Signs															
	01/01/15 - 12/31/15														
	GS = Garden State						L = Lightle					OS = Ocean State			
	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS
Size (in inches)	Eng.	Eng.	Eng.	Prism	Prism	Prism	D.G.	D.G.	D.G.	FY	FY	FY	FG	FG	FG
Impact Recovery Signs	GS	L	OS												
#234-R1-6-P Portable Impact Recovery Signs (State Law/Yield)	320	225	590												
#234-R1-6-F Fixed Base Impact Recovery Signs (State Law/Yield)	290	225	360												
Unit Totals															
Unit Totals	\$ 610.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 950.00												
Impact Recovery Signs Awarded to: Lightle															

Price Form, IFB 15-44, Traffic Signs															
	01/01/15 - 12/31/15														
	GS = Garden State						L = Lightle					OS = Ocean State			
	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS
Size (in inches)	Eng.	Eng.	Eng.	Prism	Prism	Prism	D.G.	D.G.	D.G.	FY	FY	FY	FG	FG	FG
Traffic Safety Products															
TC 18" no stripes	No Bid	5.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.08	No Bid	No Bid
TC 28" w/2 stripes	No Bid	13.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.48	No Bid	No Bid
TC 36" w/2 stripes	No Bid	17.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.89	No Bid	No Bid
Brideside for U-Channel Post D.G.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	22.3	No Bid	No Bid
Brideside for U-Channel Post FY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.2	No Bid	23.6	No Bid	No Bid
Brideside for U-Channel Post FYG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	23.6	17.2	No Bid
Brideside for U-Channel Post Red	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.8	No Bid	No Bid
Barrels w/tires and Stripes O/W	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	38.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	56	No Bid	No Bid
Barricade type A-Frame w/Stripes & Sign sleeve	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	73.1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	88	No Bid	No Bid
Barricade type 1 (wood) w/stripes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27.9	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	39.4	No Bid	No Bid
Speed Hump Section 35.5"x19.5"x2.1" High Yellow Item No. GNR-23500-Y	No Bid	95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	117.25	No Bid	No Bid
End Cap 35.5"x19.5"x0 to 2.1" High Female Item No. GNR-23501-F	No Bid	66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	73.25	No Bid	No Bid
End Cap 35.5"x19.5"x0 to 2.1" High Male Item No. GNR-23502-M	No Bid	66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	73.25	No Bid	No Bid
Unit Totals															
Unit Totals		\$ 472.30											\$ 571.90		
Traffic Safety Products Awarded to: Lightle															

Price Form, IFB 15-44, Traffic Signs															
	01/01/15 - 12/31/15														
	GS = Garden State						L = Lightle					OS = Ocean State			
	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS
Size (in inches)	Eng.	Eng.	Eng.	Prism	Prism	Prism	D.G.	D.G.	D.G.	FY	FY	FY	FG	FG	FG
Letters/Numbers															
Eng. Colors P/S 1"	No Bid	4.5	No Bid	No Bid	4.5	No Bid	No Bid	8.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.7	No Bid	No Bid
Eng. Colors P/S 2"	No Bid	5.5	No Bid	No Bid	5.5	No Bid	No Bid	9.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.9	No Bid	No Bid
Eng. Colors P/S 3"	No Bid	6.5	No Bid	No Bid	6.5	No Bid	No Bid	14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.5	No Bid	No Bid
Eng. Colors P/S 4"	No Bid	8.5	No Bid	No Bid	8.5	No Bid	No Bid	18.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.9	No Bid	No Bid
Eng. Colors P/S 6"	No Bid	12.5	No Bid	No Bid	12.5	No Bid	No Bid	22.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7.8	No Bid	No Bid
Unit Totals															
Unit Totals		\$ 37.50			\$ 37.50			\$ 73.00					\$ 21.80		
Letters/Numbers Awarded to: Garden State															
Posts	01/01/15 -														
2 lbs per foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.89	No Bid	No Bid
3 lbs per foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.92	No Bid	No Bid
5 lbs per foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.94	No Bid	No Bid
Black U Channel Post	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.14	No Bid	No Bid
Base for U Channel Post	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.99	No Bid	No Bid
Unit Totals															
Unit Totals													\$ 13.88		
Posts Awarded to: Garden State															
Traffic Pavement Products															
Construction Marking Spraypaint, various colors (per Can)															
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	37.44	No Bid	No Bid
Traffic Paint, all colors, MA Specifications (per Gallon)															
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.7	No Bid	No Bid
Glass Beads (per bag)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	28.99	No Bid	No Bid
Unit Totals															
Unit Totals													\$ 80.13		
Traffic Pavement Products Awarded to: Garden State															

Price Form, IFB 15-44, Traffic Signs															
	01/01/15 - 12/31/15														
	GS = Garden State						L = Lightle					OS = Ocean State			
	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS	GS	L	OS
Size (in inches)	Eng.	Eng.	Eng.	Prism	Prism	Prism	D.G.	D.G.	D.G.	FY	FY	FY	FG	FG	FG
Tapco Signs															
	GS	L	OS												
TAPCO Solar Powered Blinking Pedestrian or Stop Signs	\$ 1,600.00	No Bid	\$ 1,690.00												
TAPCO Solar Powered 12" Full Matrix Driver Feedback Sign**	\$ 4,375.00	No Bid	\$ 3,920.00												
TAPCO Solar Powered Radar Driver Feedback Sign 60W Control System	\$ 3,795.00	No Bid	\$ 1,460.00												
TAPCO Solar Powered Driver Feedback Sign Software Kit	included in above	No Bid	included in above												
TAPCO Solar Powered 12" 7-Segment Driver Feedback Sign**	\$ 3,295.00	No Bid	\$ 3,330.00												
TAPCO Solar Powered Radar Driver Feedback Sign 20W Control System	\$ 4,375.00	No Bid	**												
TAPCO sign pole	\$ 720.00		\$ 790.00												
Unit Totals															
Unit Totals	\$ 13,785.00		\$ 11,190.00												
<i>TAPCO Signs Awarded to: Ocean State</i>															